
Base Bid Alternate #1 Contractor Bid Bond Start Date Alternate Unit Price Unit Price
Devon. Certification Specifications Rebuild Base Additional CA-6

No Bid
83,360.00$     $29,150.00 Yes Yes Open As Specified $80.00/cy $40.00/cy
62,730.00$     $10,870.00 Yes Yes Open As Specified $125.50/cy $68.20/cy
54,000.00$     ** $9,045 Yes Yes Open As Specified $106.00/cy $28.00/cy
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
59,900.00$     $12,900.00 Yes Yes Open As Specified $85.00/cy $59.00/cy
No Bid
58,546.00$     $10,922.00 Yes Yes Open As Specified $85.00/cy $40.00/cy
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
54,330.00$     $12,756.00 Yes Yes Open As Specified $120.00/ cy $40.00/cy 
No Bid

SKOKIE PARK DISTRICT BIDS 
Parking Lot Paving Repairs

August 4, 2016; 10:00am 
Bidders

Accu- Pave Co.
A- Lamp Concrete Construction 
Abbey Paving
AllStar Asphalt, Inc.
American Pavement Solutions 
Arrow Road
Brasco Paving
Cardi Asphalt Paving Co, Inc. 
ChicagoLand Paving
Continental Construction Inc. 
Evans and Son Black Top 
Finnegan Paving
Harding Paving Co.
Jacob and Sons Inc.
Johnson Paving Inc.
Kaplan Paving
Pavement Systems, Inc.
R A Peterson
Troch McNeil No Bid

** AllStar Asphalt Alternate #1 price is based on their figure of $2.25/sqft.


